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April 22, 2014 
 
 
The Honorable Board of 
Logan County Commissioners 
117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 
Bellefontaine, OH  43311 
 
Re: Concrete Products Bids for 2014 

 April 22, 2014 at 10:00 A.M. 
 
Gentlemen: 
 
Attached is a tabulation of bids received by your honorable board on April 22, 2014 for concrete 
products to be used by the Highway and Bridge Departments during 2014. 
 
Due to the small differential in cost and the location of the bidder’s plants, I recommend that 
your honorable board adopt a resolution authorizing our department to purchase necessary 
products from each of the suppliers based upon cost, length of haul to job site and availability of 
material at the time of project requirement. 
 
In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for 
Recovery Database.  None of the bidders were listed and we have retained the certified search 
confirmation pages in the project file.   
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S. 
Logan County Engineer 
 
SCC/hlg 
 
Attachment 



2014 Concrete Products Bid Chart 

Bid Date:  April 22, 2014 
 

 
 

BID ITEM 

 
 

UNIT 

 

OHIO 

READY 

MIX 

 

SPRING 

CREEK 

CORP. 

 

BRYCE-HILL 

INC 

   

Class C Concrete $/CY $96.50 $90.00 $88.00 

Class S Concrete $/CY $106.50 $96.00 $92.00 

Low Strength 
Concrete(1500 psi) 

$/CY $65.50 $80.00 $78.00 

High Strength Non-
Shrink Grout(5000 psi) 

$/CY $99.50 $NO BID $96.00 

Low Strength Mortar, 
Type 1 

$/CY $NO BID $65.00 $61.00 

Low Strength Mortar, 
Type 2 

$/CY $NO BID $70.00 $63.00 

Additional cost for 
Superplasticizer 
Additive 

$/CY $4.50 $6.00 $5.75 

Additional cost for 
Ipanex Additive 

$/CY $32.00 $NO BID $63.00 

Trip charge for below 
minimum order 

$/load $125.00 $75.00 $85.00 

 
 

 


